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The Rise and Fall of the Afterlife
2003-09-02
belief in the afterlife is still very much alive in western civilisation
even though the truth of its existence is no longer universally
accepted surprisingly however heaven hell and the immortal soul
were all ideas which arrived relatively late in the ancient world
originally greece and israel the cultures that gave us christianity
had only the vaguest ideas of an afterlife so where did these
concepts come from and why did they develop in this fascinating
learned but highly readable book jan n bremmer one of the
foremost authorities on ancient religion takes a fresh look at the
major developments in the western imagination of the afterlife
from the ancient greeks to the modern near death experience

Answers from the Afterlife 2016
this compendium of answers provided in response to questions
posed by readers of the author s previous books will change
everything you ever thought you knew about god who you really
are the purpose of life the afterlife reincarnation psychics angels
soulmates suicide evil and much more

Letters from the Afterlife 2011-08-02
does life go on beyond the grave a growing body of evidence
suggests that it does written through the hand of elsa barker an
established author in her own right letters from the light presents
a kind of astral travelogue that describes often eloquently
sometimes humorously life in the invisible world



Letters from the Afterlife 2008-12-18
hearts from heaven is a true story of a love that transcends life on
earth leatrice marson met her husband robert in 1952 while
working at a large pharmaceutical company they married in 1953
and had three children over the next five decades their life
together was filled with love adventure and faith robert was asked
to join the companys international division in 1954 for which he
traveled to thirty three countries in 1971 the company moved him
and his family to johannesburg south africa to work on a special
project the family returned to new jersey in 1975 as their children
grew and grandchildren came into their lives leatrice and robert
continued to live a full and happy life a romantic husband robert
often left a rose on the kitchen table or a small note with a heart
on it for leatrice when he left for work although cancer eventually
took roberts life in 2001 he has continued to be a presence in her
life beginning about a month after his death roberts form
appeared to her in church and then other mysterious signs of his
presence began happening as evidenced in this beautiful
heartwarming book hearts from heaven leatrice has received
many hearts from heaven from her beloved robert they often show
up in the most unexpected ways but always at just the right time

Hearts from Heaven 2014-08-11
at the very foundation of religious faith and hope is a belief that
consciousness will survive death and that we will live on in another
dimension of reality but that foundation easily crumbles when
scientific minds are unable to wrap their brains around an afterlife
when they are unable to visualize a non material world as the
foundation gives way the philosophy of materialism takes hold and
gives rise to moral decadence egocentricity hypocrisy hatred
disorder flux strife chaos and fear such seems to be the state of
the world today there is so much to be found outside the highly



guarded boundaries of mainstream science and orthodox religion
for those willing to open their minds to it for those willing to
recognize that the dissemination of truth did not stop with the
good books of organized religion and cannot always be found in
the laboratory beginning in 1848 a number of sensitive people
began developing as mediums bringing forth communications from
the spirit world one of the skeptics investigating the popular
madness was professor robert hare of the university of
pennsylvania intending to debunk it all hare would after extensive
research become a believer when he asked an apparently
advanced spirit what it was all about he was told that it was a
deliberate effort on the part of the inhabitants of the higher
spheres to break through the partition which has interfered with
the attainment by mortals of a correct idea of their destiny after
death unfortunately both orthodox religion and mainstream
science acting out of ego and fear have rebuked the efforts of
those inhabitants of the higher spheres to enlighten us thus
permitting the foundations of both faith and hope to further
crumble in the afterlife revealed michael tymn sets forth some of
the most credible messages from the spirits relative to the nature
of their world instead of a heaven hell dichotomy we are told that
there are many levels or as jesus is quoted many mansions and
that we cross over to the other side based on what might be called
a moral specific gravity we discover a divine plan one of
attainment and attunement of gradual spiritual growth of evolution
of spirit through progressively higher planes we see how we are
really souls occupying bodies rather than bodies housing souls and
how our souls are progressing in finding their way back to oneness
with the creator through the challenges the adversities the trials
and tribulations offered us in a particular lifetime



The Afterlife Revealed 2011-05
in visits from the afterlife sylvia describes her personal encounters
with ghosts and explains their appearances in visiting haunted
homes ships and other locations she comes face to face with
troubled spirits who are still unaware of their own fate discover
why some homes are haunted and what to do about it what the
difference is between spirits and ghosts the meaning of our
nightmares and visions what psychic attacks are and why they
should concern us sylvia s personal experiences with hauntings
involving celebrities what it feels like to be a ghost sylvia browne
takes readers on a journey through the afterlife and provides an
unprecedented look at how the spirit world influences our daily
lives

Visits From The Afterlife 2012-03-08
after her son erik committed suicide at age twenty a physician
who had always placed her faith in science finds her skepticism of
life after death turning into belief when erik begins communicating
with her from the other side

Signs from the Afterlife 2010-08-05
get back into the spirit of appreciating your life share in sylvia
browne s extraordinary lessons of wisdom and comfort from the
other side keeping life in perspective is difficult for everyone for
many holidays birthdays and anniversaries become overwhelming
events not to mention job changes family crises and personal
issues we become preoccupied with things we cannot change and
lose sight of what really matters now renowned psychic and 1 new
york times bestselling author sylvia browne helps us celebrate and
appreciate life by reminding us of the countless blessings we



received before coming into this world with chapters on
forgiveness past lives contacting the other side and discovering
life s purpose sylvia browne tells uplifting stories of people she has
helped to find their way sylvia browne believes that if we can
remember why we are here and what we are supposed to be doing
here our lives will ultimately become happier healthier and more
spiritually fulfilling

My Son and the Afterlife 2013-10
a father watches his teenage son step out the door on a hiking trip
not knowing that this is the last time he would see him a journal of
grief despair and ultimately hope this book tells the story of every
parent s nightmare the sudden death of a child and a father s
search for meaning in a seemingly random world of psychics and
skeptics expanding on territory covered in his 2008 memoir of his
son s death soul shift messages from the afterlife is both an
account of ireland s journey from indifference to belief and an
overview of the resources available to the bereaved to help them
receive messages from the afterlife mark ireland son of celebrated
psychic to the stars dr richard ireland was a successful marketing
executive in arizona with little interest in his father s colorful
history while his father held readings for mae west and traveled
the u s demonstrating his parapsychological powers mark ireland
took a more conventional route through life but when his own
teenage son brandon suddenly dies while hiking in the mountains
with friends ireland is forced to confront his resistance to all things
spiritual and begins to explore the possibility that communication
with the dead is real in his search for conclusive evidence of life
after death he plunges into his father s world and meets an array
of respected psychic mediums who deliver unexpected messages
not only from his son in the afterlife but also from many other
souls seeking to communicate with the living fighting to retain a
sense of critical thinking ireland also contacts scientists



conducting research into the survival of consciousness after death
the book features detailed accounts of tests and experiments that
various people have conducted to obtain proof of consciousness
survival including ireland s own involving a secret message left
behind by his sister robin who died of pancreatic cancer the
contents of this message were unknown to any living person and
remained sealed in an envelope untouched until responses had
been received from a group of qualified mediums who sought to
crack the code messages from the afterlife shows how spirit
communication can be both undeniably accurate and frustratingly
ambiguous and above all demonstrates the value of having an
open receptive mind while maintaining faith in the indestructiblity
of the human spirit

Blessings From the Other Side
2000-11-01
a powerful new book for our successful talking to dead people
genre by two of australia s top psychics when t j an inner city
sydney teen gets into a fight with a group of boys and is stabbed
to death it s far from the end of his story through an amazing
series of events ezio and michelle begin to receive messages from
t j reflecting back on his life and telling of his many intriguing
experience of life beyond death woven through this compelling
account are a wealth of stories from those who have passed over
meet jenny who gets message from her baby boy who passed over
who reveals there s another baby boy for her on the way janet
tells of her moving reconciliation with her brother tony who died in
a car accident find out what rebecca s murdered brother matthew
had to say about his killers when she makes contact these
fascinating stories and more reveal a great deal about life beyond
death



Letters from the Afterlife 2008-12-18
in egyptian mythology the phoenix was a bird that rose from the
ashes of death to attain immortality in this book spiritual healer
and counselor lily fairchilde takes us on a magical voyage during
which we learn in the words of those who have gone on before
what awaits each of us after life on earth is over what happens
when a child dies a friend commits suicide or a lost soul finally
ends a dark earthly life in song of the phoenix we encounter many
different souls accompanied by their spiritual guides of angels who
explain the significance of their stories rather than a place of
reward and punishment the afterlife is a wondrous experience of
ongoing growth and understanding ruth surrendered to despair
after her husband s wartime death and committed suicide also
killing her unborn child terrified of punishment her soul resisted
passing over until her guardian angel convinced her that only love
and understanding awaited her joey was a six year old who was
killed in a sledding accident and whose parents agonized over his
death he yearns only to reassure them that he has entered a
glorious world of brilliant light edith and frank are troubled spirits
who cleave to earthly souls who share their addictions to
overeating and alcohol but their guardians refuse to abandon
them until they realize that a far more rewarding joy awaits them
if only they accept it xavier has led an evil life as a sadistic killer
and his soul suffers torment in a wasteland of isolation and pain
but even he has a guardian angel who patiently waits for him to
receive the love and encouragement that will guide him home
these extraordinary personal stories told by lily fairchilde bring a
message of glowing hope and comfort to all those who have
suffered the agony of loss or are confronting the fear of death
themselves profound and compassionate this book shows the
living how to make peace with death



Messages from the Afterlife 2013-12-10
discover the enlightening and comforting true stories of mark
anthony the psychic lawyer as he helps people communicate with
their loved ones in spirit evidence of eternity is an uplifting journey
that removes the fear and superstition surrounding spirit contact
while addressing poignant questions about the afterlife it provides
insights on painful subjects such as crime homicide suicide and
survivor guilt by bridging the gap between the spiritual and
scientific this groundbreaking book brings spirit communication
into the modern era while reaffirming that god and heaven exist
the soul is an immortal living spirit and that we will be reunited
with our deceased loved ones evidence of eternity introduces new
and innovative terms and concepts explaining spirit
communication based on science theoretical physics physiology
theology and evidence from karma and reincarnation to embracing
the inner light evidence of eternity is a cutting edge perspective of
life after death watch mark anthony discuss evidence of eternity
here praise mark anthony the psychic lawyer is exceptionally
qualified to write about the afterlife he is a renowned psychic
medium and attorney who presents powerful evidence that
deceased loved ones can communicate with us the insights are
powerful inspiring and could change your life dr jeffrey long author
of evidence of the afterlife the science of near death experiences
evidence of eternity is an absolutely riveting book full of highly
evidential fascinating cases and much spiritual wisdom five stars
plus dr kenneth ring author of lessons from the light a riveting
book that opens your heart and mind to the reality of the afterlife
this book is unforgettable and its messages are empowering read
this right now dr joe vitale author of zero limits and star of the
secret addresses murder suicide death of children and unresolved
family issues with a mix of passion and logic like no other william
buhlman of the monroe institute for out of body experiences
evidence of eternity logically explains the afterlife all the while



demonstrating that faith and science are not mutually exclusive
deborah king author of be your own shaman and truth heals
evidence of eternity is provocative stirring endearing and hopeful
for a guide to strong spiritual connection and means to personal
discovery this is a book you want to read dr my haley widow of
alex haley and collaborator on his new york times bestseller roots

Postcards from the Other Side
2012-06-01
this unique handbook provides a sophisticated scholarly overview
of the most advanced thought regarding the idea of life after
death its comprehensive coverage encompasses historical
religious philosophical and scientific thinking starting with an
overview of ancient thought on the topic the palgrave handbook of
the afterlife examines in detail the philosophical coherence of the
main traditional notions of the nature of the afterlife including
heaven hell purgatory and rebirth in addition and breaking with
traditional conceptions it also explores the most recent exciting
advance digital models later sections include analysis of various
possible metaphysical accounts that might make sense of the
afterlife including substance dualism emergent dualism and
materialism and the science of near death experiences as well as
the links between human psychology and our attitude to the
afterlife key features grounded in the most advanced philosophical
theological and scientific thinking contributions by eminent
scholars from the world s top universities balanced treatment of
fundamental issues that are relevant to everyone diverse
approaches ranging from the religious to the scientific from the
optimistic to the pessimistic a major section on the meaning of the
afterlife which includes chapters on fear purpose evil and issues
regarding identity the palgrave handbook of the afterlife is
essential reading for scholars researchers and advanced students



researching attitudes to and effects of beliefs about death and life
after death from philosophical historical religious psychological
and scientific perspectives

Song of the Phoenix 2014-11-18
fearless deep and snarky and did i mention funny oh my goodness
this guy is funny dean nelson author god hides in plain sight and
director writer s symposium by the sea at point loma where do we
go when we die will we have personal chats with god on fluffy
clouds what are the odds i will be devoured by a demon life s
deepest mysteries question what happens when life is over with
pocket guide to the afterlife jason boyett becomes your tour guide
to the great beyond from the profound to the profane from the
light at the end of the tunnel to your ascension to the celestial
void here s everything you need to know this side of the
everlasting unknown including what to expect upon arrival in
destinations like heaven purgatory and the chinvat bridge whether
your understanding of the christian hell comes from the bible or
from an italian poet which dream scenarios you ll want to avoid
because they predict your impending demise why defibrillators are
so important when it comes to having near death experiences
pondering your eventual demise has never been so much fun

Evidence of Eternity 2015-03-08
what would you give to have a daily conversation with a lost soul
mate whether it is a spouse parent sibling relative child or best
friend dr liong tee understood that need when his soul mate
passed away consider the possibility there have been many signs
from your loved one both big and small that were right in front of
you all the time but you simply failed to recognize them have you
ever asked yourself why you keep experiencing a familiar smell a
certain shape a distinctive color a special flower or perhaps a



favorite animal that appears over and over again reminding you of
your lost loved one or did you simply brush those incidents aside
dismissing them as only being a coincidence based on his written
journals follow dr tees incredible story of conversations signs and
messages received from his lost soul mate jan since her passing in
june 2008

The Palgrave Handbook of the Afterlife
2017-10-12
over half of americans believe in a literal heaven in a literal hell
most people who hold these beliefs are christian and assume they
are the age old teachings of the bible ehrman shows that eternal
rewards and punishments are found nowhere in the old testament
and are not what jesus or his disciples taught he recounts the long
history of the afterlife ranging from the epic of gilgamesh up to the
writings of augustine focusing especially on the teachings of jesus
and his early followers ehrman shows that competing views were
intimately connected with the social cultural and historical worlds
out of which they emerged adapted from jacket

Pocket Guide to the Afterlife
2009-07-08
choices in the afterlife isbn 0 9766779 0 3 articulates our after
death processes as self realization assimilation healing and or
progression without the physical body we begin our deceased
experience near the earth and progress until we choose either to
ascend which is the return to god source or choose to remain
within the potential for another lifetime on earth readers comes
away from the book convinced they will continue to make choices
after death with the same mind personality attitudes and spiritual
awareness that they had in physical life



Witnessing Conversations with Heaven
2012-08-07
an uplifting study of the scientific evidence for the afterlife from an
experienced anesthesiologist intensive care physician details
meticulously recorded and hospital verified cases of near death
experiences cites scientific research on ndes to refute the
standard objections of doubters and materialists point by point
explores out of body experiences sessions with mediums
electronic communication with the deceased and other signs from
the afterlife over the course of his 25 year career as an
anesthesiologist and intensive care physician jean jacques
charbonier m d gathered hundreds of accounts of patients who
returned from clinical death across all of these accounts from
patients with vastly different backgrounds dr charbonier found
striking similarities as well as indisputable proof that these
experiences were more than hallucinations he surveyed other
physicians nurses and professional caregivers and discovered that
their patients described the same experiences as well as exhibited
the same positive life transformations afterward igniting a
scientific quest to learn more he collected more accounts of near
death experiences as well as out of body experiences attended
dozens of sessions with mediums experimented successfully with
electronic communication with the deceased evp interviewed
hundreds of people who have cared for the dying and gathered
countless inexplicable stories of signs from the afterlife with each
experience he studied he found himself more firmly believing in
the survival of consciousness beyond death dr charbonier distills
his findings into 7 reasons to believe in the afterlife beginning with
the more than 60 million people worldwide who have reported a
transcendent afterlife experience he refutes the standard
objections of doubters and materialists point by point citing
scientific research on ndes and the work of pioneers in the field of



consciousness studies such as raymond moody and pim van
lommel drawing on meticulously recorded and hospital verified
cases dr charbonier explains that we should not fear death for
ourselves or our loved ones by releasing our fear of death we can
properly prepare for the final journey as those who have returned
from death reveal death is simply a transition and its lessons
enable us to live more fully peacefully and happily in the now

Heaven and Hell 2021-03-23
much has been written about death and the afterlife there are
however few books devoted to the souls of those who leave our
world in difficult sudden and sometimes tragic conditions a car
accident a disease a refusal of hope in the existence of another
reality or a murder what happens to them what do they
experience and what can we do to help them with these souls who
leave us marie johanne croteau meurois tackles these questions

Choices in the Afterlife 2007
based on the largest near death experience study in history
involving 3 000 people from diverse backgrounds and religious
traditions including nonbelievers god and the afterlife presents
startling evidence that a supreme being exists and there is
amazing consistency about what he is like in his bestselling book
evidence of the afterlife dr jeffrey long showed us that there is a
strong scientific case for life after death now he goes further
revealing evidence that god is real at the near death experience
research foundation dr long studied the stories of thousands of
people who have journeyed to the afterlife though there are a wide
variety of differences in how people experience ndes some see a
bright light others go through a tunnel still others experience a
review of their life he discovered that many of the accounts shared
a remarkably similar description of god a supreme being who



radiated love and grace expanding on his analysis begun in
evidence of the afterlife god and the afterlife is the first intensive
exploration of the people who have reported going to the frontier
of heaven met god and have returned to share their journey
groundbreaking and profound it provides new insight into the
human experience and expands our notions of mortality offering
possibility hope and comfort

7 Reasons to Believe in the Afterlife
2015-03-07
an esteemed scientist s personal journey from skepticism to
wonder and awe provides astonishing answers to a timeless
question is there life after death are love and life eternal this
exciting account presents provocative evidence that could upset
everything that science has ever taught daring to risk his
worldwide academic reputation dr gary e schwartz along with his
research partner dr linda russek asked some of the most
prominent mediums in america including john edward suzane
northrup and george anderson to become part of a series of
extraordinary experiments to prove or disprove the existence of
an afterlife the afterlife experiments this riveting narrative with its
electrifying transcripts puts the reader on the scene of a
breakthrough scientific achievement contact with the beyond
under controlled laboratory conditions in stringently monitored
experiments leading mediums attempted to contact dead friends
and relatives of sitters who were masked from view and never
spoke depriving the mediums of any cues the messages that came
through stunned sitters and researchers alike here as they
unfolded in the laboratory setting are uncanny revelations about a
son s suicide what a deceased father wanted to say about his last
days in a coma the transformation of a man s lifelong doubts
about the afterlife and most amazing of all a forecast of a beloved



spouse s death dr schwartz was forced by the overwhelmingly
positive data to abandon his skepticism reaching some startling
conclusions compelling from the first page to the last the afterlife
experiments is the amazing documentation of groundbreaking
experiments you will never forget

Souls Who Leave Us 2019-05-20
colin fry is the acclaimed star of 6ixth sense and psychic private
eyes and is uk tv s leading psychic medium not only are his
viewing figures huge he also tours the country speaking to
massive audiences so many people want to see him because he s
the keeper of remarkable secrets when loved ones pass over
where do they go how do you know if they re ok are they still
aware of us can they do anything to help is there a way to keep in
touch with them what s it like on the other side in this
extraordinary book colin explains how understanding the spirit
world has made his own life so much easier and he also describes
how many many people ask him to connect with their loved ones
who have passed over the stories of these encounters make
incredible reading you will not be surprised by the amount of
comfort he can bring to others but you will be amazed by the
secrets he discovers from the afterlife and how hearing them can
change your perspective forever

God and the Afterlife 2016-06-28
a grand survey of the world s death and afterlife traditions
throughout history examines beliefs from many different cultures
on the soul heaven hell and reincarnation instructions for
accessing the different worlds of the afterlife how one may
become a god and how ethics and the afterlife may not be
connected explores techniques to communicate with the dead
including séance instructions includes an extensive bibliography of



more than 900 sources from around the world drawing on death
and afterlife traditions from cultures around the world mark
mirabello explores the many forms of existence beyond death and
each tradition s instructions to access the afterlife he examines
beliefs on the soul heaven hell and reincarnation and wisdom from
books of the dead such as the book of going forth by day from
egypt the katha upanishad from india the bardo thodol from tibet
the golden orphic tablets from greece lieh tzu from china and
heaven and its wonders and hell from things heard and seen from
18th century europe considering the question what is death
mirabello provides answers from a wide range of ancient and
modern thinkers including scientist nicholas maxwell the seer
emanuel swedenborg 1st century buddhist philosopher nagarjuna
and greek philosopher euripides who opined that we may already
be dead and only dreaming we are alive he explores the trek of
the soul through life and death with firsthand accounts of the
death journey and notes that what is perceived as death here may
actually be life somewhere else he reveals how in many traditions
ethics and the afterlife are not connected and how an afterlife is
possible even without a god or a soul sharing evidence that
consciousness is not simply a product of the brain he offers a
strong rebuttal to nihilists materialists and the lokayata
philosophical school of india who believe in the finality of death he
explains how specters and ghosts are produced and offers
techniques to communicate with the dead as well as instructions
for an out of body experience and the complete procedure for a
séance with an extensive bibliography of more than 900 sources
this guide offers comprehensive information on afterlife beliefs
from the vast majority of cultures around the world and
throughout history a veritable traveler s guide to the afterlife



The Afterlife Experiments 2002-03-13
an exploration of the rituals beliefs art and mythology humans
have used to understand death and the afterlife examines a wide
range of practices and traditions mexico s day of the dead
victorian funeral customs the tibetan book of the dead the burial of
pharoahs cryonics and ideas from the bible to show a variety of
human responses to death

Secrets from the Afterlife 2008-09-04
have you a family member or a friend ever wondered about what
it s like after we leave this earth do you know someone who is
fearful of death have you recently lost a dear loved one or a pet
and wonder where they are or what they are doing michele a
livingston is a spiritual medium endorsed by world renowned
evidential medium james van praagh who calls her a trance
channel using these abilities for living in the afterlife experiences
from the soul place michele was able to communicate with the
souls of her departed relatives clients friends and other spirits
bringing new insight and understanding of the heavenly realms
not only what we experience at the time of our death but what we
may actually be doing when we finally make transition to the other
side through actual communication with these souls that are now
in heaven michele brings new insight and understanding about
what happens after we die and it may not be what you think or
believe there is as much to do there spiritually as there is to do
physically here on earth we can teach study with ascended
masters and experts from any discipline help other souls make
transition guide people souls still on earth and even re create our
own favorite memories from our last lifetime or we can simply
relax and do nothing the information michele received came from
a broad range of departed souls throughout history including well
know celebrities suicide victims soldiers and more therefore



michele was able to paint a picture of what we may expect not
only as we make transition but as our life continues in the soul
place our true home

A Traveler's Guide to the Afterlife
2016-09-15
in 2004 bad boy billy fingers cohen a homeless small time drug
dealer and addict in a state of drug induced euphoria ran into a
busy intersection and was killed instantly by a speeding
automobile he left behind a grieving sister for weeks she struggled
with grief and tried to make sense of billy s seemingly wasted life
and tragic death a few weeks after his death william cohen aka
billy fingers woke his sister annie at dawn i m drifting weightlessly
through these glorious stars and galaxies and i feel a divine
presence a kind loving beneficent presence twinkling all around
me billy s ongoing after death communications take his sister on
an unprecedented journey into the bliss and wonder of life beyond
death billy s profound detailed description of the mystical realms
he traverses the beings of light that await him and the wisdom he
receives take the reader beyond the near death experience billy is
indeed as dr raymond moody points out in his foreword explaining
the phenomena we ve known about since ancient times an
afterworld walker a fascinating page turner filled with wisdom
humour and hope the afterlife of billy fingers will forever change
your views about life death and the hereafter if i could give you a
gift it would be to find the glory inside yourself beyond the roles
and the drama so you can dance the dance of the game of life with
a little more rhythm a little more abandon a little more shaking
those hips



Death and the Afterlife 1984
in her first book living with the gift tj higgs shared the gripping
account of her rise from difficult beginnings to becoming one of
the nation s leading celebrity mediums in signs from the afterlife
she reveals the wisdom and psychic insights that have made her
the star she is today brimming with incredible true stories signs
from the afterlife explains the ways in which tj receives messages
from the other side and communicates amazingly accurate
information from those who have passed over more than this signs
from the afterlife tells readers how they can use tj s psychic
techniques for themselves through reading the signs that are to be
found all around us we too can connect more closely with our lost
loved ones and become the masters of our destinies generous
warm and with a great sense of humour tj shows us how to decode
the signs from the afterlife that are all around us

Living in the Afterlife 2018-08-12
this volume offers a survey about what is known about the ancient
egyptians vision of the afterlife and an examination of these
beliefs that were written down in books that were later discovered
in royal tombs the contents of the texts range from the collection
of spells in the book of the dead which was intended to offer
practical assistance on the journey to the afterlife to the detailed
accounts of the hereafter provided in the books of the netherworld
the author looks closely at these latter works while summarizing
the contents of the book of the dead and other widely studied
examples of the genre for each composition he discusses the
history of its ancient transmission and its decipherment in modern
times supplying bibliographic information for any text editions he
also seeks to determine whether this literature as a whole
presents a monolithic conception of the afterlife the volume
features many drawings from the books themselves



The Afterlife of Billy Fingers
2014-08-04
does life end at death the answer is no the nearly 2 000 cases of
departing visions and visitations from deceased relatives and
friends collected by the author prove that there is life after death
at the moment of physical death departed loved ones return to the
dying to ease travel from this life to the next friends family and
healthcare workers also report seeing these loving spiritual travel
guides such encounters reported by individuals from a wide
variety of cultural ethnic and religious backgrounds clearly
illustrate that the personality soul or consciousness does not
disappear or die to live our lives to the fullest we must relieve
ourselves of the false notion that death is the end departing
visions help us do this heavenly hugs will introduce you to both
historical and modern day departing visions proving the dying
have been reuniting with the departed for centuries departed
loved ones escort the dying to the other side or next dimension
something has often been seen leaving the physical body at the
moment of death famous people have experienced beautiful
departing visions

Life After Death 2002
answers from heaven is for anyone who has ever wondered if
there is an afterlife and if it is truly possible to contact the spirit
world in this compelling book sunday times bestselling author
theresa cheung and medium claire broad share the fascinating
true stories of ordinary people who have experienced direct
communication from the spirit world and those who have received
proof of survival through a reading with claire answers from
heaven outlines the many different ways that heaven may answer
our prayers offer us comfort and provide proof of survival and



includes the top ten afterlife signs what near death experiences
can tell us the meaning of visions and dreams the importance of
intuition and coincidence advice on visiting a medium as well as
examining the ways in which messages can come to us from the
other side answers from heaven outlines the latest scientific
research on the afterlife and mediumship and helps shed light on
one of the most important questions about human experience
what happens after we die it also shares the practical steps we can
all take to become more attuned to the medium that lies within us
and recognise the signs that heaven is calling

Letters From The Afterlife (Volume 1 of
2) (EasyRead Super Large 24pt Edition)
2010-08-05
a scientific exploration into humanity s obsession with the afterlife
and the quest for immortality from the bestselling author and
sceptic michael shermer in his most ambitious work yet shermer
sets out to discover what drives humans belief in life after death
for millennia the awareness of our own mortality and failings has
led to religions concocting comforting notions of an afterlife of
heaven and hell utopias and dystopias and of the perfectibility of
human nature heavens on earth explores the numerous
manifestations of the afterlife a place where souls might go after
the death of the physical body religious leaders have toiled to
make sense of this place that a surprisingly high percentage of
people believe exists but from which no one has ever returned to
report what it is really like this is one of the most profound
questions of the human condition and has long driven philosophers
and theologians to try to understand the meaning and purpose of
life for mortal beings and how we can transcend mortality shermer
details recent scientific attempts to achieve immortality by radical
life extentionists extropians transhumanists cryonicists and mind



uploaders along with utopians who have attempted to create
heaven on earth heavens on earth concludes with an uplifting
paean to purpose and progress and what we can do in the here
and now whether or not there is a hereafter

Signs From The Afterlife 1999
a moving and inspirational memoir of love loss and renewal
promised by heaven tells the amazing story of how one woman s
near death experience and glimpse of heaven led her to discover
her gifts of healing and share them with the world in december of
1991 mary helen hensley was involved in a car accident that
changed her life forever upon impact traveling at more than
seventy five miles per hour she felt time stall and temporarily left
her body in those moments mary helen was consumed with a
sudden clarity she realized she had the choice to either remain in
her body or exit from the earth allowing the remainder of the
scene to unfold without feeling any pain she chose to depart from
her body and enter heaven in heaven mary helen was welcomed
by two angels who walked her through the place of light and
encouraged her to go back to earth and help others when she
returned to earth mary helen was suddenly struck with a desire to
live a life of service and quickly set out on a journey into
metaphysical healing her adventures took her to ireland where she
went on to become a chiropractor find love and new friendships
become a mother and help numerous people with her gifts of
communicating with the dead and seeing into the future promised
by heaven is a remarkable spiritual journey that questions
everything we understand to be true describing in great detail her
experience in heaven meeting angels and returning to earth a
changed woman mary helen hensley offers an unforgettable
account of her path to find her true calling



The Ancient Egyptian Books of the
Afterlife 2012-11-22
can love endure even after death the afterlife revolution written by
whitley and anne strieber is among the most convincing stories of
afterlife communication ever told and is a ringing endorsement not
only of the fact that we do not die but also that the power of love
can create an actual bridge between the physical and nonphysical
worlds after anne strieber died in august 2015 she returned to her
husband whitley in an ingenious and convincing way whitley
began to communicate with her and the afterlife revolution began
out of this exchange of love from both worlds whitley s grief at her
loss has transformed into a warm and deeply satisfying new form
of love after a near death experience in 2004 anne strieber
became an expert in afterlife studies and created an ingenious
plan of contact which to her husband whitley s amazement she
proceeded to carry out starting just an hour and a half after she
died as verified by famed afterlife researcher dr gary schwartz who
wrote the foreword the afterlife revolution is among the most
convincing stories of afterlife communication ever told and is a
ringing endorsement not only of the fact that we do not die but
also that the power of love can create an actual bridge between
the physical and nonphysical worlds the book points the way to a
new relationship between the living and as anne puts it what you
call the dead anne tells of her experience on the other side saying
that we are light alive and that enlightenment is what comes when
there is nothing left of us but love her descriptions of the afterlife
communicated to whitley from the afterlife are brilliantly articulate
and nuanced at once deeply familiar and uniquely her own the
afterlife revolution shows how to use basic tools such as what
anne describes as objective love combined with a simple but
special form of meditation to build a relationship between physical
and nonphysical worlds it is intended to help us find that sweet



point at which the souls of the living touch those of the dead as
anne says mankind is divided not so much between the sexes as
between the living and what are called the dead it isn t natural
and it isn t necessary we can become whole the afterlife revolution
is about the joy of doing just that and the magnificent new human
experience that will unfold as more and more of us learn to live in
this way

Heavenly Hugs 2017-11-02
there are very few accounts of the afterlife across the period from
homer to dante most traditional studies approach the classical
afterlife from the point of view of its evolution towards the
christian afterlife this book tries to do something different to
explore afterlife narratives in spatial terms and to situate this
tradition within the ambit of a fundamental need in human
psychology for the synthesis of soul or self and universe drawing
on the works of homer plato cicero virgil and dante among others
as well as on modern works on psychology cartography and music
theory mapping the afterlife argues that the topography of the
afterlife in the greek and roman tradition and in dante reflects the
state of scientific knowledge at the time of the various contexts in
which we find it the book posits that there is a dominant spatial
idiom in afterlife landscapes a journey vision paradigm the
horizontal journey of the soul across the afterlife landscape and a
synoptic vision of the universe many scholars have argued that
the vision of the universe is out of place in the underworld
landscape however looking across the entire tradition we find that
afterlife landscapes almost without exception contain these two
kinds of space in one form or another this double vision of space
brings the underworld as the landscape of the soul into contact
with the scientific universe and brings humanity into line with the
cosmos



Answers from Heaven 2018-01-25
every person who has ever lived has wondered about that place
beyond mortality shakespeare called it the undiscovered country
people have longed to uncover the secrets that shroud death and
the afterlife asking questions such as what actually happens at the
moment of death will we know our loved ones in heaven what will
we do in eternity what happens to babies and toddlers when they
die will we interact with the angels in heaven because god wrote
the bible for the sole purpose of helping men and women prepare
for eternity there s no better place to go for trustworthy answers
bible expert ron rhodes takes us to the scripture to provide an
incredibly clear and inspirational picture of the next life explore
the wonder of heaven and the afterlife anticipate what is to come
on the other side of eternity in heaven the undiscovered country

Heavens on Earth 2015-09-08

Promised by Heaven 2020

The Afterlife Revolution 2020-04-03

Mapping the Afterlife 2003-04-08

Heaven: The Undiscovered Country
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